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MEETING DATE: September 2019 

COMMITTEE: Empowerment Committee  

COMMITTEE CHAIR: Valerie Roberts Gray  

COMMITTEE MEMBERS 
PRESENT: 

Charlesetta Ford, Barbara Mitchell, Sadie Kiel, Debra  Barnes, 
Carolyn Dyson  

 
 

DATE OF LAST MEETING: June 24  

ACTION ITEMS IN 
PROGRESS: 

Empowerment Conference:  
The Empowerment Conference was held Saturday, May 18 at Solano 
Community College, Vallejo Center. Approximately 75-80 plus were 
in attendance. General feedback was very positive.  
 
The committee finalized all invoices and receipts (attached) for the 
final report. A wrap up meeting was held June 24 at Soror Gray’s 
home. Based on a review of the conference evaluations, budget 
allocations and rigorous committee discussion, the committee 
recommendation was to proceed with the Empowerment Conference 
for the 2019-2020 sorority year and to garner feedback and support 
from chapter members on the best way to proceed. Several options 
and a chapter survey were developed. Based on the survey results, 
the committee will present a suggested format for the conference.  
 
Dress for Success:  
The chapter has been contacted to participate in the upcomintg 
Dress for Success event Friday, October 25 at Jesse Bethel High 
School. The chapter has been requested to provide 50 scarves for 
girls in attendance 
 

BUDGET REQUIREMENTS: 
Funding was obtained through a previous Kaiser Permanente grant 
($2500), The chapter apply for but did not receive a second grant this 
summer from KP. Feedback from KP representatives was that the 
chapter should re-apply during the next cycle in January.  

ACTION ITEMS 
COMPLETED: 

Participate in the upcoming Dress for Success event October 25.  

Review chapter survey results and bring recommendation to the 
executive board for the Empowerment Conference.   
 

  
 


